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Concept Note

"Behind No Walls: Lives on Construction Sites"
is an exploration into the dynamic world of
construction sites, where the absence of
physical barriers reveals a unique dimension
of human interaction and experience. Through
a series of visually compelling photographs,
this project seeks to capture the raw essence
of life amidst the exposed framework of
construction.

The central theme of this project revolves
around the concept of "no walls," both literal
and metaphorical. To uncover the untold
stories and hidden dynamics that unfold. From
the camaraderie of laborers to the
improvisation of makeshift shelters, "Behind
No Walls" explores the resilience and
adaptability of individuals in the face of
uncertainty in time.

This project employs a participatory approach
to document the life experiences of
construction site workers. Through immersive
observation, informal conversations, and
collaborative photography sessions, we seek
to cultivate an intimate understanding of the
social dynamics and cultural practices that
shape life "behind no walls."
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Facing Peril
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Facing Peril
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Their Strength
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Their Strength
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Peace
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Peace
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Bread and Butter
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Bread and Butter
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Home
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Done for the day!
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